
End User License Agreement Terms & 
Conditions for the Downloadable App 
Brattleboro Savings & Loan endeavors to provide you with the highest quality Mobile Banking 
(the "Service") available. By enrolling in the Service, you agree to all the terms and conditions 
contained in this Agreement and Disclosure (the "Agreement"). 

We may offer additional Mobile Banking services and features in the future. Any such added 
Mobile Banking services and features will be governed by this Agreement and by any terms and 
conditions provided to you at the time the new Mobile Banking service or feature is added and/or 
at the time of enrollment for the feature or service, if applicable. From time to time we may 
amend these terms and modify or cancel the Mobile Banking services we offer without notice, 
except as may be required by law. 

You must agree to these terms before using the downloadable app necessary to participate in the 
BS&L Mobile Banking Service. You may contact us at (802)-254-5333 if you have questions 
about this Agreement. 

Definitions 
As used in this Agreement and Mobile Banking services, the following words have the meanings 
given below: 

"Account(s)" means your eligible Brattleboro Savings & Loan checking or savings account. 
"Device" means a supportable mobile device including a cellular phone or other mobile device 
that is web-enabled and allows secure SSL traffic which is also capable of receiving text 
messages. Your wireless carrier may assess you fees for data or text messaging services. Please 
consult your wireless plan or provider for details. "Mobile Banking" means the banking 
services accessible from the Device you have registered with us for Mobile Banking. "You" and 
"Your(s)" mean each person with authorized access to your Account(s) who applies and uses 
the Mobile Banking service. "We," "Us," "Our" and "Bank" means Brattleboro Savings & 
Loan. 

Mobile Banking Service 

1. Description of Service 

Mobile Banking is offered as a convenience and supplemental service to our Online Banking 
services. It is not intended to replace access to Online Banking from your personal computer or 
other methods you use for managing your accounts and services with us. Mobile Banking allows 
you to access your Bank account information, make payments to payees, transfer funds between 
your own accounts and conduct other banking transactions. To utilize the Mobile Banking 
Service, you must be enrolled to use Online Banking and then activate your Device by 



downloading our Mobile Banking App. Information about our Mobile Banking service is 
available on our website at www.brattbank.com. We reserve the right to limit the types and 
number of accounts eligible and the right to refuse to make any transaction you request through 
Mobile Banking. We may also reserve the right to modify the scope of the Service at any time. 

Mobile Banking may not be accessible or may have limited utility over some network carriers. In 
addition, the Service may not be supportable for all Devices. We cannot guarantee and are not 
responsible for the availability of data services provided by your mobile carrier, such as data 
outages or "out of range" issues. 

2. Use of Service 

In order to properly use Mobile Banking, you should review and follow the Mobile Banking 
FAQs on our website. You agree to accept responsibility for learning how to use Mobile Banking 
in accordance with the online instructions and agree that you will contact us directly if you have 
any problems with Mobile Banking. We may modify the Service from time to time at our sole 
discretion. In the event of any modifications, you are responsible for making sure you understand 
how to use Mobile Banking as modified. You also accept responsibility for making sure that you 
know how to properly use your Device and we will not be liable to you for any losses caused by 
your failure to properly use the Service or your Device. 

3. Other Agreements 

You agree that, when you use Mobile Banking, you remain subject to the terms and conditions of 
your existing agreements with any unaffiliated service providers, including, but not limited to, 
your mobile service provider and that this Agreement does not amend or supersede any of those 
agreements. You understand that those agreements may provide for fees, limitations and 
restrictions which might impact your use of Mobile Banking (such as data usage or text 
messaging charges imposed on you by your mobile service provider for your use of or 
interaction with Mobile Banking), and you agree to be solely responsible for all such fees, 
limitations and restrictions. You agree that only your mobile service provider is responsible for 
its products and services. Accordingly, you agree to resolve any problems with your provider 
directly without involving us. Any deposit account accessed through this Service is also subject 
to the Account Agreements and Disclosures provided at the time of Account opening. You 
should review the Account disclosures carefully, as they may include transaction limitations and 
fees, which might apply to your use of Mobile Banking. 

4. Permitted Mobile Banking Transactions 

You may view balances, transaction history, and images of checks. All transactions originated 
through your Device are subject to the same terms and cut-off times as published within 
NetTeller online banking. You may make scheduled payments to existing payees. You may also 
use the Service to transfer funds between your eligible accounts at our Bank. You may not 
transfer to or from an Account at another financial institution using Mobile Banking. You must 
have sufficient funds available in the selected account at the time the transfer request is received, 
including any available overdraft protection. Federal regulations require us to limit the way 

http://www.brattbank.com/


withdrawals may be made from a savings or money market account. Each transfer from a savings 
or money market account using Mobile Banking is counted as one of the six (6) limited 
transactions permitted each monthly statement cycle period, as described in the Deposit Account 
Agreement and Disclosures. We may also limit the type, frequency and amount of transfers for 
security purposes and may change or impose the limits without notice, at our option. You agree 
to confirm the completion of each transfer in your account balance and transaction history before 
withdrawing transferred funds. 

Your Responsibilities 
You represent and agree to the following by enrolling for Mobile Banking or by using the 
Service: 

1. Account Ownership/Accurate Information 

You represent that you are the legal owner of the Accounts and other financial information 
which may be accessed via Mobile Banking. You represent and agree that all information you 
provide to us in connection with Mobile Banking is accurate, current and complete, and that you 
have the right to provide such information to us for the purpose of using Mobile Banking. You 
agree not to misrepresent your identity or your account information. You agree to keep your 
account information up to date and accurate. You represent that you are an authorized user of the 
Device you will use to access Mobile Banking. 

2. User Security 

You agree to take every precaution to ensure the safety, security and integrity of your account 
and transactions when using Mobile Banking. You agree not to leave your Device unattended 
while logged into Mobile Banking and to log off immediately at the completion of each access 
by you. You agree not to provide your username, password or other access information to any 
unauthorized person. If you permit other persons to use your Device, login information, or other 
means to access Mobile Banking, you are responsible for any transactions they authorize and we 
will not be liable for any damages resulting to you. You agree not to use any personally 
identifiable information when creating shortcuts to your Account. We make no representations 
that any content or use of Mobile Banking is available for use in locations outside of the United 
States. Accessing Mobile Banking from locations outside of the United States is at your own risk 
and expense. 

3. User Conduct 

You agree not to use Mobile Banking or the content or information delivered through Mobile 
Banking in any way that would: (a) infringe any third-party copyright, patent, trademark, trade 
secret or other proprietary rights or rights of privacy, including any rights in the Software; (b) be 
fraudulent or involve the sale of counterfeit or stolen items, including, but not limited to, use of 
Mobile Banking to impersonate another person or entity; (c) violate any law, statute, ordinance 
or regulation (including, but not limited to, those governing export control, consumer protection, 



unfair competition, anti-discrimination or false advertising); (d) be false, misleading or 
inaccurate; (e) create liability for us or our affiliates or service providers, or cause us to lose (in 
whole or in part) the services of any of our service providers; (f) be defamatory, trade libelous, 
unlawfully threatening or unlawfully harassing; (g) potentially be perceived as illegal, offensive 
or objectionable; (h) interfere with or disrupt computer networks connected to Mobile Banking; 
(i) interfere with or disrupt the use of Mobile Banking by any other user; or (j) use Mobile 
Banking in such a manner as to gain unauthorized entry or access to the computer systems of 
others. 

4. License 

You acknowledge and agree that the third party provider of the mobile banking apps 
("Licensor") is the owner of all right, title and interest in and to the downloaded software 
("Software") to be used for access to BS&L's Mobile Banking Services. Software includes the 
computer programs contained therein in machine- readable object code form as well as any 
accompanying user documentation along with all subsequent copies, updates or versions which 
are made available to you, regardless of the media or form in which they may exist. Subject to 
the terms and conditions of this Agreement, you are granted a limited, nonexclusive right to use 
the Software in accordance with the terms of this Agreement. All rights not explicitly granted to 
you by this Agreement are reserved by the Software owner. Nothing in this license will entitle 
you to receive hard-copy documentation, technical support, telephone assistance, or updates to 
the Software. This Agreement may be terminated at any time, for any reason or no reason. Upon 
termination, you agree to immediately destroy all copies of the Software in your possession or 
control. 

5. Indemnification 

Unless caused by our intentional misconduct or gross negligence, you agree to indemnify, defend 
and hold harmless Brattleboro Savings & Loan, its officers, directors, employees, consultants, 
agents, service providers, and licensors from any and all third party claims, liability, damages, 
expenses and costs (including, but not limited to, reasonable attorneys' fees) caused by or arising 
from (a) a third party claim, dispute, action, or allegation of infringement, misuse, or 
misappropriation based on information, data, files, or otherwise in connection with the service; 
(b) your violation of any law or rights of a third party; or (c) your use, or use by a third party, of 
Mobile Banking. 

6. Content and Services 

Neither Licensor nor the provider of the wireless network is the provider of any financial 
services available through or related to the Software, and neither Licensor nor the provider of the 
wireless network or any contractor of the provider of the financial services available through or 
related to the Software, is responsible for any of the materials, information, products or services 
made available to you via the Software. 

 



7. Disclaimer Warranty 

THE SOFTWARE IS PROVIDED ON AN "AS IS" AND "AS AVAILABLE" BASIS 
WITHOUT WARRANTIES OF ANY KIND, EITHER EXPRESS OR IMPLIED, INCLUDING, 
BUT NOT LIMITED TO, THE IMPLIED WARRANTIES OF MERCHANTABILITY, 
FITNESS FOR A PARTICULAR PURPOSE AND NON-INFRINGMENT. NO WARRANTY 
IS PROVIDED THAT THE SOFTWARE WILL BE FREE FROM DEFECTS OR VIRUSES 
OR THAT OPERATION OF THE SOFTWARE WILL BE UNINTERRUPTED. YOUR USE 
OF THE SOFTWARE AND ANY OTHER MATERIAL OR SERVICES DOWNLOADED OR 
MADE AVAILABLE TO YOU THROUGH THE SOFTWARE IS AT YOUR OWN 
DISCRETION AND RISK, AND YOU ARE SOLELY RESPONSIBLE FOR ANY DAMAGE 
RESULTING FROM THEIR USE. 

8. Limitations of Warranty 

TO THE MAXIMUM EXTENT PERMITTED BY APPLICABLE LAW, IN NO EVENT WILL 
LICENSOR, THE PROVIDER OF ANY FINANCIAL SERVICES AVAILABLE THROUGH 
OR RELATED TO THE SOFTWARE, ANY OF THEIR CONTRACTORS OR PROVIDERS 
OR ANY OF EACH OF THEIR AFFILIATES BE LIABLE FOR ANY DAMAGES ARISING 
OUT OF THE USE OR INABILITY TO USE THE SOFTWARE, INCLUDING BUT NOT 
LIMITED TO ANY GENERAL, SPECIAL, INCIDENTAL OR CONSEQUENTIAL 
DAMAGES, EVEN IF ADVISED OF THE POSSIBILITY THEREOF, AND REGARDLESS 
OF THE LEGAL OR EQUITABLE THEORY (CONTRACT, TORT OR OTHERWISE) UPON 
WHICH ANY CLAIM IS BASED. IN ANY CASE, LIABILITY OF LICENSOR OR ANY OF 
THE OTHER PERSONS OR ENTITIES DESCRIBED IN THE PRECEDING SENTENCE 
ARISING OUT OF THE USE OR INABILITY TO USE THE SOFTWARE SHALL NOT 
EXCEED IN THE AGGREGATE THE LESSER OF $10.00 OR THE SUM OF THE FEES 
PAID BY YOU FOR THIS LICENSE. 

9. U.S. Government Restricted Rights 

The Software is commercial computer software subject to RESTRICTED RIGHTS. In 
accordance with 48 CFR 12.212 (Computer software) or DFARS 227.7202 (Commercial 
computer software and commercial computer software documentation), as applicable, the use, 
duplication, and disclosure of the Software by the United States of America, its agencies or 
instrumentalities is subject to the restrictions set forth in this Agreement. 

10. Miscellaneous 

This Agreement constitutes the entire agreement between the parties concerning the subject 
matter hereof. This Agreement will be governed by and construed in accordance with the laws of 
the state of Vermont excluding that body of laws pertaining to conflict of laws. If any provision 
of this Agreement is determined by a court of law to be illegal or unenforceable, such provision 
will be enforced to the maximum extent possible and the other provisions will remain effective 
and enforceable. All disputes relating to this Agreement are subject to the exclusive jurisdiction 
of the courts of Vermont and the parties expressly consent to jurisdiction and venue thereof and 



therein. The parties confirm that this Agreement and all related documentation are and will be in 
the English language. The application of the United Nations Convention on Contracts for the 
International Sale of Goods is hereby expressly waived and excluded. 
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